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With tax season just behind us, we
know  many questions can arise
around minister tax and filing. The
experts at ChurchBiz can walk you
through all your questions and
simplify the process.   Click here for
our article on some helpful wisdom
for you and your team to know.

 

The ChurchBiz Podcast is a
conversation on all things ChurchBiz,
church finance, and other important
financial things that will benefit you
and your team. This week in our first
episode, we look back at the history
of ChurchBiz and where we hope to
go in the future. Click here and listen
in!

Click here to read our first ever guest
newsletter article written by Chris
Mallonee's (ChurchBiz Partner)
father, David, who led a ministry for
many years called  Concepts in
StewardshIp. Be on the lookout for
more guest contributors in coming
newsletters!
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Meet Our Team!
Each newsletter we want to spotlight
one of our ChurchBiz team
members. This week we are
highlighting Tyler Gatewood. He's
been with the team 2 years. Tyler is
married to Meghan and has 2 boys,
Gram and Rhett. Besides serving at
ChurchBiz, he spends his time
serving as a pastor and counselor
with Redeemer Round Rock.
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